CITY of NOVI CITY COUNCIL

Agenda ltem |
June 27, 2016

| &

cityofnovi.org

SUBJECT: Approval to purchase new vehicles as follows: one (1) 2016 Ford F-150 pickup truck
from Jorgensen Ford, the low bidder, in the amount of $28,000 ; and one (1) 2016
Chevrolet Colorado pickup truck from Berger Chevrolet in the amount of $26,674 using the
Oakland County cooperative purchasing contract.

SUBMITTING DEPARTMENT: Flncnc@fﬂ )

CITY MANAGER APPROVAL: 22

EXPENDITURE REQUIRED $ 54,674

AMOUNT BUDGETED 101-265.00-983.000 $ 28,000 (FY 16/17)
101-371.00-983.000 $ 51,684 (FY 16/17)

APPROPRIATION REQUIRED $0

LINE ITEM NUMBER 101-265.00-983.000 $ 28,000
101-371.00-983.000 $ 26,674

BACKGROUND INFORMATION:
These vehicles are budgeted in Fiscal Year 16/17 and will replace existing fleet vehicles.

Facilities Management will receive one (1) Ford F-150 for daily departmental operations.
Community Development will receive one (1) Chevrolet Colorado to be used by the
Landscape Architect to conduct daily business including inspections and project
oversight.

RECOMMENDED ACTION: Approval to purchase new vehicles as follows: one (1) 2016 Ford F-150
pickup fruck from Jorgensen Ford, the low bidder, in the amount of $28,000 ; and one (1)
2016 Chevrolet Colorado pickup truck from Berger Chevrolet in the amount of $26,674
using the Oakland County cooperative purchasing confract.

112/ Y| N 1|2]|Y([N
Mayor Gatt Council Member Markham
Mayor Pro Tem Staudt Council Member Mutch
Council Member Burke Council Member Wrobel
Council Member Casey




CITY OF NOVI

NEW 2016, 2017 VEHICLES

SPECIFICATIONS

cityofnovi.org

B. New 2014-2017 Ford F-150 (or equivalent), 4 x 4, Super Cab, 8' box
Quantity: One (1)

e Color: Race Red
e Interior: Gray or Black

Equipment. Standard Package, plus the following:
V8 Engine (minimum 5.0 L), Gas

Electronic é-speed SelectShift Transmission with Tow/Haul Mode
Power Steering

Cruise conftrol

Power windows

Power door locks

Remote Keyless Entry

Four-wheel anti-lock brakes

Air Conditioning

AM/FM Stereo

Seats: Front, 40/20/40 HD cloth

Intermittent windshield wipers

Tilt Steering

Floor covering: black vinyl, full

Roof Clearance Lights

Front Tow Hooks (2)

Trailer Sway Control

Wheels: 17" silver steel (5)

Tires: 265/70R17 OWL All Terrain (5)

Required Options:

Rear Axle — Electronic Locking

Trailer Tow Package-7-wire harness w/relays & 7/4 pin connector
Integrated trailer brake controller

Trailer Tow Mirrors — Power adjust, heated

Upfitter Switches (4)

Cab Steps - black step bars

Splash guards/mud flaps, front & rear

Spray-in bedliner (including tailgate guard and black bed bolts)



CITY OF NOVI

NEW 2016-17 VEHICLES BID TAB

June 8, 2016 2:00 P.M.

Qty Varsity Ford Gorno Ford Jefferson Chevrolet Jorgensen Ford Brighton Ford
B. Ford F-150, 4x4, Super Cab,
8' box (or equiv) 1
Unit Price ea No Bid $ 28,380.00 | $ 35,069.00 | $ 28,000.00 | $ 32,392.15
2016 Ford F150 XL, 2017 Chevrolet 2500HD
Yr, Make, Model Super cab, 4x4 4x4, crew cab 2016 Ford F150 2016 Ford F150
Delivery 10-12 weeks TBD 75 days ARO 8-10 weeks after order
Upfitter switches not available.
Factory roof clearance lights & | 2500 HD crew for box - 1500 | No roof clearance lights, no Mudflaps & roof clearance
Exceptions upfitter switches not available N/A with long box upfitter switches lights added as accessories.
No 2016 to match specs.
Build out of 2016 model year | for 2016 model, must order by
Comments is 71M/186. 71116, Must be ordered by 6/30/16
C. GMC Terrain, AWD (or
equiv) 1
Unit Price ea No Bid No Bid $ 23,514.00 No Bid No Bid
2017 Chevrolet Equinox
Yr, Make, Model AWD LS
Delivery TBD
Exceptions
Comments
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ORIGINOAL

CITY OF NOVI
BID FORM

Y
| -ci.t» AR
cityalnmvion

NEW 2016, 2017 VEHICLES

L]

We, the undersigned as bidder, propose lo furnish to the Cily of Novi, according to the
terms, conditions, specifications, and instruclions altached hereto:

Prices must be quoted as Lump Sum (including fitle, delivery, etc.).
The City Is Tax Exempl.

Please include a sheel for each type of vehicle showing breakdown of pricing & cost of
options included. You must indicate any deviations from specifications on these sheets.

A. Three (3) F-350 Pickup (or equivalent), 4 x 4 Regular Cab, SRW, WITH PLOW, per
specificalions

$.35500.,00 __ each (Delivered)
Year, Make, Model 20 17 O R B Fe3

Deviafion from specificgilfs: WHEEE BAse (18 92"

One (1) Ford F-150 Pickup (or equivalent), 4 x 4 Super Cab, per specifications
$2 8000, QO each (Delivered)
Year, Make, Model 2 O /6 [FoRD /50

Delivery date_75 DRYS ARG e e
Deviation from specifications: No_Rawf CLEARANCE L IGHTS,

No UPFITTER SwiTCHES

Comments: MusT BE ORbERED_BY &-30~-/6
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One (1) GMC Terrain (or equivalent), AWD, per specifications

$ No Bip each (Delivered)

Year, Make, Model

Delivery date . = S

Deviation from specifications: R -

Comments: — N

One (1) Chevrolet Colorado Pickup (or equivalent) 4 x 4 Extended Cab, per
specifications

$ No Bup each (Delivered)

Year, Make, Model R ————

Delivery dale o

Deviation from specifications: o —

Comments:

Page 13 of 15



Deviation from specifications: EQ&GINE 1S L5 [ EcoBoosT
WIT H START~STreP TECHNOLOGY

Comments: N S ———
F. Two (2) Chevrolet Cruze (or equivalent), per specifications
$ AN BID each (Delivered)

Year, Make, Model

Delivery date.

Deviation from specifications:

We acknowledge receipt of the following Addenda: =~ B
(please indicate numbers)

Do you accept payment via Purchasing Card (credit card)? _Yg S .
Please indicate service charges to use Purchasing card, if any: AMEX 2, 1% - Visn me Discover s 2

NON-IRAN LINKED BUSINESS

By signing below, | certify and agree on behalf of myself and the company submitting
this proposal the following: (1)that | am duly autherized fo legally bind the company
submitting this proposal; and (2) that the company submitting this proposal is not an
“Iran linked business,” as that lerm is defined in Section 2(e) of the Iran Economic
Sanctions Act, being Michigan Public Act No, 517 of 2012; and (3) That | and the
company submitting this proposal will immediately comply with any further certifications
or information submissions requested by the City in this regard.
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Company (Legal Registration) &LQ RAENSEN Ford

Address 8333 MICHIGAN AVENUE .
City DEer Rar i State_ M) Zip 482 /O
Telephone 312 584 87 33 Fox 313 584 a4 77 —

Representative's Name (please print) Bisre. M CARTHY ———
Representative'sTile FL a7 MANAG € R —
Representative's Signc}iureéi,_f _7_%_ & '3:.{'"" 2

E-mail bil b mecarth y @ hetmail.cem
Date _6- &6 ~/&
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CITY OF NOVI

NEW 2016, 2017 VEHICLES

SPECIFICATIONS

cityofnovi.org

D. New 2016-2017 Chevrolet Colorado 4x4 (or equivalent), extended cab, long box
Quantity: One (1)
e Exterior color: Red Hot
e Interiorcolor:  Jet Black

Standard equipment (WT model) including the following:
e 25014 DIDOHC VVT engine

4 wheel antilock brakes

6-speed automatic transmission

4 wheel drive

GVWR 5000 lbs

Rear axle, 4.10 ratio

Stability control system

Traction Control

Standard wheels

Full size spare tire

AM/FM stereo

Air bags

Power door locks

Power driver seat

Tilt wheel

Power windows

Air conditioning

Required options:
e Automatic locking rear differential
Bed liner
Speed Control
Cloth seats
Vinyl flooring
EZ lift tailgate
Assist steps, black



Oakland (oanty contradt

iy WHEVROLETGOLORADO
RK TRUCK 4WD 12M53 r
Body Style:  Work Truck - Extended Cab Name  Berger Chevrolet Inc
[NOTE' Model Should include STANDARD PACKAGING, unless otherwise|Address 2525 28th Street SE
indicated below 1
Address Grand Rapids, MI 48512
2
Contact Bob Evans
Telephon 616-949-5200
Standard Equipment Plus MINUS COST
B38 Viny! Floor Covering
MYB Automatic Transmission
PLUS TITLE FEE
MINUS TOTAL| $ -
STANDARD COST SUBTOTAL & 24,725.00 | )
POSSIBLE OPTIONS:
WT Convenience Package, includes (ATG) Remote
Keyless Entry, (UTJ) theft-deterrent system, (K34)
electronic cruise control and (PPA) EZ-Lift tallgate (req
PCN H2R Dash Ash// Jet Black cloth interior seating) { $ 45000 |)
Audio System, Chevrolet MyLink, 4 2" diagonal color r———
104 screen with AM/FM stereo $ 26200
ATZ Seat delete, rear $ 198 00
Work Truck Appearance Package, includes (RS1)
16"x7" Requires (PCN) WT Convenience Package and
PCX (H2R) Dark Ash/Jet Black cloth interior seating $ 401 00
CGN Bed Liner, Spray-On, Black $ 43900
VZX LPO, Bed liner $ 367 00
ZWe Pickup box, delete $ 264 00
Differential, automatic locking rear (available with (LCV)
2 5L |4 engine Req (282) Trallering Package when
(LFX) 3 8L SIDI DOHC V6 engine 1s ordered Not
GB0 available with (N8D) 6-speed manual transmission $ 305 00
Engine, 3 6L SIDI DOHC V6 VT (305 hp (229 kW) @
LFX 6800 rpm, 269 Ib-ft or torque (365 N-m) @ 4300 rom) $ 1,106 00
ROY Fleet Free Maintenance Credit $ 49 00
Rear axle, 3 42 ratio (req {(LFX) 3 6L SIDI DOHC V&
GU6 engimne N/C
Tow/Haul Mode (included and only available with (LFX)
5G8 3 6L SIDI DOHC V6 engine N/C
Trailering Package, heavy-duty, includes trailer hitch and
7-pin connector Regq (LFX) 3 6L SIDI DOHC V6 engine
and (G80) automatic locking rear differential  Not
Z82 available with (LCV) $ 235 00
LWN 2 8L Duramax Diesel $ 5,397 00
TOTAL OPTIONS
TOTAL COST| $ -
AUTHORIZED NAME (Print) Robert Evans
AUTHORIZED SIGNATURE:* : | DATE 8/28/2015
Black ASs1ST STERS L5000
e/ very /774,50

¥ 24,673.50



BID PER ENCLOSED SPECIFICATIONS

Cost per vehicle $ $26,673.50

Number of units

[4=2

Total Bid Amount $ $26,673.50

Vendor:
Berger Chevrolet Inc.

Address 2525 28th Street S.E.

Grand Rapids. MI 49512

Phone (616) 949-5200

Fax (616)988-9178

Signature ?~/// Za®)

Printed Signature Robert M. Evans

Date 6/10/2016

Vehicle Description:
Year 2016
Make Chevrolet

Model Colorado Ext Cab
4WD

Bid Prepared For:

City of Novi

Price includes title fee and delivery.
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